
1. Person responsible for personal data: 

The person responsible for personal data, i.e., H. The company that processes the personal data of the 
data subject is the company LJ Design s.r. o. with registered office in Požiarna 825/24 020 01 Púchov, 
IČO: 46944150, registered in the commercial register of the Trenčín District Court, department: Sro, filing 
number: 27470/R (hereinaŌer referred to as “Operator”).  

The Operator processes personal data in accordance with Law 122/2013 on the ProtecƟon of Personal 
Data, as amended, and other legal provisions (hereinaŌer referred to as “Law No. 122/2013”). From May 
25, 2018, instead of Law No. 122/2013, the operator will regulate the processing of personal data of data 
subjects by RegulaƟon of the European Parliament and of the Council (EU) 2016/679 on the protecƟon 
of natural persons regarding the processing of personal data and on free movement of data (General 
Data RegulaƟon). ProtecƟon) and Law No. 18/2018, on the protecƟon of personal data and amending 
certain laws. 

 

2. Purposes and legal basis for processing personal data: 

If there is a contractual relaƟonship between the data subject and the operator, the operator processes 
personal data of the data subject based on the legal Ɵtle of the contract only to the extent necessary to 
fulfill the purposes of this contract. 

The operator processes the personal data of data subjects based on the legal Ɵtle of legiƟmate interest 
and exclusively to the extent of the name, address, email, telephone number, the processing of which is 
necessary to achieve the purposes menƟoned above. If the data subject provides the operator with his 
or her personal data voluntarily and without the operator's prior intervenƟon, such personal data will be 
processed by the operator to the extent necessary based on the legal Ɵtle of legiƟmate interest (for the 
purpose of assessing the concern). the data subject and providing a response to the data subject. 

 

3. DuraƟon of storage of personal data: 

All personal data will be processed only to the extent necessary to fulfill the purposes set out in point 2 
of these General Terms and CondiƟons and only for the period necessary to achieve the said purposes, 
but no longer than the period established by the relevant legal regulaƟons or in accordance with these. 

Personal data that the operator processes based on the data subject's legal Ɵtle of consent will be 
processed unƟl the consent is revoked; However, the operator may process some of this data even aŌer 
withdrawing consent if there is another legal reason for doing so (e.g. to prove the accuracy and legality 
of the procedure for processing personal data or to enable the defense against legal claims). 

Personal data that the operator processes based on the legal Ɵtle of legiƟmate interest or personal data 
that the operator processes for direct markeƟng purposes will be processed unƟl the data subject 
objects to the processing of his or her personal data. 

 

 



4. IdenƟficaƟon of recipients of personal data: 

The operator may only pass on the personal data of the data subject to third parƟes if this is required or 
permiƩed by law or if the data subject has consented. The operator only makes personal data available 
to processors or other recipients to the usual extent: 

Providers of external services for the operator (programming or other technical support services, server 
services, email sending, services related to measuring traffic on our pages and adapƟng their content to 
user preferences), Operators of backup servers or operators of technologies used by the operator who 
process them to ensure the funcƟonality of the operator's respecƟve services, to the extent necessary, 
the operator's legal, economic and tax advisors as well as the operator's auditors, who process these for 
the purpose of advising the operator. 

 

5. Rights of those affected: 

(Right of access to personal data) The data subject has the right to request from the operator, based on a 
request, confirmaƟon as to whether or not personal data of the data subject is being processed and, in 
the affirmaƟve, to request the provision of this informaƟon about the processing of personal data of the 
data subject. The data subject has the right to recƟficaƟon of personal data concerning him or her 
regarding the purpose of the processing of personal data, as well as to the compleƟon of incomplete 
personal data. In the event of processing of personal data based on the legal Ɵtle of the contract or on 
the legal Ɵtle of the data subject's consent, the data subject has the right to portability of the personal 
data concerning him that he has provided to the operator in a structured, common and machine-
readable manner Format if personal data of the data subject is processed in an automated form and 
before the expiry of the personal data retenƟon period. The exercise of this right must not have a 
detrimental effect on the rights of other persons. The data subject has the right to dispose of the 
personal data (the right to erasure of personal data) that are the subject of the processing if: 

Personal data is processed in violaƟon of the law or based on the withdrawal of the data subject's 
consent (in the case of processing personal data, based on the legal Ɵtle of the data subject's consent) or 
The data subject objects to the processing of personal data processed on the basis of the legal Ɵtle of 
the Operator's legiƟmate interest and the Operator's legiƟmate reasons for processing personal data do 
not prevail, or the personal data is no longer necessary for the purpose for which it was collected or 
otherwise processed. AŌer the expiry of the retenƟon period for personal data. The right to dispose of 
personal data in accordance with point five leƩer d) does not apply if the processing of personal data is 
necessary for the operator: 

Exercising the right to freedom of expression or exercising the right of access, fulfilling the obligaƟons 
provided for by Law No. 18/2018 on the ProtecƟon of Personal Data and amendments to other laws (in 
force from May 25, 2018) or special regulaƟons, 

Exercising a legal right for archival purposes, for scienƟfic purposes, for historical research purposes or 
for staƟsƟcal purposes in accordance with SecƟon 78 (8) if it is likely that the law pursuant to paragraph 
1 will make the achievement of the objecƟves of this processing impossible or seriously difficult. The 
right to restrict the processing of personal data if: the data subject objects to the accuracy of the 
personal data, during the period allowing the operator to verify the accuracy of the personal data and 



any update of the personal data, the processing of personal data is unlawful, and the data subject 
objects to the deleƟon of personal data and instead requests the restricƟon of their use, the operator no 
longer needs the personal data for the purposes of processing personal data, but the data subject needs 
them to exercise a legal right, or the data subject objects to the processing of personal data in 
accordance with SecƟon 27 (1) GDPR. 1 of Law No. 18/2018 on the ProtecƟon of Personal Data and 
amending other laws (valid from May 25, 2018), pending verificaƟon whether the legiƟmate reasons of 
the operator prevail over the legiƟmate reasons of the data subject. 

The right to object to the processing of personal data: 

The data subject has the right to object to the processing of personal data concerning him in all cases in 
which the legal right to the processing of personal data exists in the legiƟmate interest of the operator. 
The data subject has the right to object to the processing of personal data concerning him or her, even if 
such personal data are processed for the purposes of direct markeƟng, including profiling to the extent 
that it is related to direct markeƟng. If there is a suspicion that personal data is being processed without 
authorizaƟon, the data subject has the right to submit a proposal to iniƟate a personal data protecƟon 
procedure to the Office for Personal Data ProtecƟon. If the legal ground for the processing of the data 
subject's personal data is his or her consent, the data subject may revoke this consent at any Ɵme, free 
of charge, at the email address provided below. Withdrawal of consent will not affect the lawfulness of 
processing based on consent given before its withdrawal. The data subject has the right to withdraw his 
consent at any Ɵme by sending an email to peter.kamhal@lj-design.net or in wriƟng to the operator's 
address, which is: LJ Design s.r.o., Požiarna 825/24, 020 01 Púchov 

Puchov, January 31, 2024 

LJ Design s.r.o. 


